
UOM QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1
275-201-00024 

25kVA 240/120
EA 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,707.00 $30,828.00

2
275-201-00025 

50kVA 240/120
EA 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,300.00 $65,100.00

3
275-201-00026 

100kVA 240/120
EA 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,167.00 $97,336.00

4
275-201-00044 

75kVA 240/120
EA 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,460.00 $83,680.00

TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $276,944.00

Vendor Preference 

Price

UOM QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1
275-201-00024 

25kVA 240/120
EA 4 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2
275-201-00025 

50kVA 240/120
EA 7 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

3
275-201-00026 

100kVA 240/120
EA 8 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4
275-201-00044 

75kVA 240/120
EA 8 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Invitation to Bid Number 22-0018WH Tabulation

Single Phase Pad Mount Distribution Transformers for Stock

Central Moloney                                                                        

Jan Patterson                                                                        

PO Box 6608                                                                                 

Pine Bluff, AR 71611                                                      

(870) 543-6571                                                                                                                                                              

jpatterson@centralmoloneyinc.com

Item # Description

Anixter, Inc. Cooper Power Systems                                                  

Brian Tiley                                                                               

51 Steel Drive                                                             

New Castle, DE 19720                                                        

(302) 298-3606                                                                                                              

brian.tiley@anixter.com 

Item # Description

Anixter, Inc.  GE Quote                                                  

Brian Tiley                                                                               

51 Steel Drive                                                             

New Castle, DE 19720                                                        

(302) 298-3606                                                                                                              

brian.tiley@anixter.com

Howard Industries                                      

Melanie Pickering                                               

3225 Pendorff Road                                            

Laurel, MS 39440                                 

(601) 422-1413                                          

mpickering@howard-ind.com                                             

WEG Transformers                                         

Tammy Faupel                                        

One Pauwels Drive                                             

Washington, Missouri 63090                                              

(636) 239-9334                                           

tfaupel@weg.net                     

Irby  GE Quote                                                                   

Tim Long                                                  

1025 Cobb Intl. Pl. Ste A                                                     

Kennesaw, GA 30152                                                 

(770) 422-1005                                                    

tlong@irby.com 


